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ABSTRACT  
An emerging social ethic for animal welfare that seeks to improve the welfare of animals in 
industrial farming is evident in the growing demand for products perceived to be ‘animal 
friendly’. Research examining consumer response to ‘animal friendly’ products has focused 
on the food product category despite the extensive use of animal fibres, fur, and skins in the 
production of clothing and textiles. How consumers respond to animal welfare issues in the 
clothing and textile product category is of particular interest to animal production industries. 
This paper explores ethical consumers’ response to ‘animal friendly’ labelling of wool 
apparel. Five focus group interviews were conducted with American female ethical 
consumers to elicit beliefs and attitudes towards social labels applied to wool apparel that 
incorporate animal welfare principles. The focus group data indicated that consumers’ beliefs 
about social labels, in terms of perceived credibility, transparency, and relevance of the label 
to the product, influence their attitude towards the label and subsequent purchase intentions. 
Further, it appeared that consumer beliefs about the ethical issue(s) articulated by social 
labels influence consumer attitudes and purchase intentions.  
 
 
ARTICLE 
________________________________________________________________ 
 
Introduction 
 
Over the past forty years, society has grown increasingly concerned about the treatment of 
farm animals due to changing demographics, a questioning of accepted human traditions, 
changes in the nature of animal use, and changes in agricultural production practices (Rollin 
1990, 1995, 2004). Traditional societal ethical standards for animal welfare and the laws 
embodying them (i.e., anti-cruelty laws) were restricted to the deliberate, wilful, and 
unnecessary infliction of pain and suffering on animals, or to outrageous neglect, such as 
failing to provide food and water (Rollin 1990). However, the majority of animal suffering is 
not caused by the sadists targeted by anti-cruelty laws. Rather, it results from putatively 
decent motives, such as providing cheap food and textiles, augmenting biomedical 
knowledge through research, or testing product safety (Dawkins 1980). Such behaviour 
tends to be invisible to anti-cruelty laws (Rollin 1990). 
 
However, a new social ethic has emerged to regulate animal suffering that is not the result of 
deliberate cruelty (Rollin 2006). It is embodied in attempts to create the functional equivalent 
of limited rights for animals by constraining animal property use (as property, animals cannot 
have rights) (Rollin 2004). Hence there have been calls for tougher animal welfare legislation 
(Bennett 1996; Frewer and Salter 2002; Harrison 1992; Steenkamp 1997; Verbeke et al. 
1999) and a proliferation of new laws across the Western world limiting what people can do 
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to animals (Rollin 2006). In the European Union, for example, legislation requires larger 
cages for laying hens from 2012 and prohibits the use of sow gestation stalls from 2013 
(Tuyttens et al. 2008). In Australia, the Tasmanian government announced the phasing out of 
the use of sow stalls from 2010, with a total ban on their use coming in to force in 2017.1 
 
Changes in the social ethic for animal welfare are also reflected in consumer activism, 
including an increase in demand for products perceived to be more ‘animal friendly’ (Frewer 
and Salter 2002; Harper and Makatouni 2002; Morris 2000; Southwell, Bessey, and Barker 
2006). For example, studies have found that consumers were willing to purchase eggs 
produced with animal-friendly management practices (Bennett 1997; Rolfe 1999). Such 
research identified consumers’ concerns about the welfare of caged layer hens, which has, in 
turn, influenced legislators to increase cage sizes in the European Union (Appleby 2004). 
However, most studies investigating consumer response to animal welfare and ‘animal 
friendly’ products have focused on food items, despite the extensive use of animal fibres,2 
fur, and skins in the production of clothing and textiles.  
 
How consumers respond to animal welfare issues in the clothing and textile product 
categories is of particular interest to animal production industries, such as the Australian 
wool industry, which has been the target of anti-cruelty activism and retail boycotts. Wool is 
an important apparel fibre that generates retail sales of approximately US$75 billion a year 
for the clothing and textile industry (Millward Brown Pty Ltd 2007). Wool has the largest 
share of the animal fibre market and Australia is the largest supplier of apparel wool, 
producing 46% of wool fibre used in clothing production in 2004. The Australian wool industry 
has been the target of a highly publicised anti-cruelty campaign. In 2004, People for the 
Ethical Treatment of Animals (PETA) launched an international retail and consumer 
campaign (‘Save the Sheep’3) against the Australian sheep industry, calling for an end to the 
live export of sheep from Australia and to the ‘barbaric’ practice of mulesing lambs (People 
for the Ethical Treatment of Animals 2005). Mulesing4 is a ‘one-off’ surgical procedure 
performed on-farm to remove wool-bearing skin from the breech area of lambs in order to 
prevent flystrike5 (Lee and Fisher 2007; Primary Industries Standing Committee 2006). 
Mulesing has traditionally been performed on sheep in Australia without anaesthetic or 
analgesics (Phillips 2009). Although flystrike is a problem in all sheep-producing countries, 
the risk of flystrike is particularly high in Australia due to susceptible breeds of sheep and 
climatic conditions (Phillips 2009). 
 
PETA’s campaign against mulesing is based on an argument that the procedure causes 
unnecessary pain and suffering to sheep (People for the Ethical Treatment of Animals 2004). 
PETA have supported this assertion with independent, empirical research identifying physical 
(Chapman, Fell, and Shutt 1994; Fell and Shutt 1988; MAF 1996; Shutt et al. 1987), 
behavioural (Chapman et al. 1994; Fell and Shutt 1989), and psychological (Chapman et al. 
1994; Fell and Shutt 1989) indicators of stress and pathology caused by mulesing (Cook and 
Steiner 1990; Gherardi 2002; Harrington and Steiner 1993; Horton and Champion 2001; 
Karlsson, Evans, and Greeff 2001; MAF 1996). The Australian wool industry has largely 

                                                 
1 www.dpiw.tas.gov.au/inter.nsf/ 
2 The main animal fibres used in clothing production are wool, cashmere, angora, mohair, and silk 
(www.natural fibres2009.org). 
3 www.savethesheep.com 
4 Mulesing is the surgical removal of wool-bearing skin, on lambs aged from 2 to 12 weeks, from either 
side of the breech and around the tail using curved or straight edged sheers. The scarring that occurs 
as a result of mulesing flattens the skin around the breech and tail stump and reduces the build up of 
secretions that attract flies. 
5 Flystrike occurs when flies lay their eggs in soiled areas of wool on the sheep. The larvae burrow into 
the skin, impeding animal growth, damaging wool, and causing septicaemia, which can lead to the 
death of the sheep host. In Australia, the main species responsible for flystrike in sheep is the blowfly 
Lucilia cuprina.  
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refuted PETA’s claims, counter-arguing that it would be detrimental to animal welfare to 
prevent farmers from mulesing their sheep, as this is the most effective way to prevent 
flystrike (Australian Wool and Sheep Industry Taskforce 2008; Australian Wool Innovation 
2008b). 
 
The ‘save the sheep’ campaign has persuaded a number of apparel retailers, including AB 
Lindex, Kukdong, Perry Ellis, Matalan, Hennes and Mauritz, Adidas, and Hugo Boss, to 
choose not to use wool from mulesed sheep in their garments (People for the Ethical 
Treatment of Animals 2008). Pressure from apparel manufacturers and retailers convinced 
the Australian wool industry to commit to phasing out mulesing by the end of 2010 
(McLachlan and Pietsch 2005). This commitment has since been withdrawn, leaving the 
industry exposed to further PETA-led boycotts of Australian wool.  
 
Despite an ongoing battle with PETA over the practice of mulesing and the live sheep trade, 
the Australian wool industry has investigated opportunities to market wool as an ‘ethical’ 
natural apparel fibre. In 2006, the industry research and development corporation (Australian 
Wool Innovation (AWI) Ltd) commissioned a report on customer requirements for ‘ethical 
wool’ which urged the industry to develop niche businesses around the positive 
environmental image of wool (The Woolmark Company 2006). Further, the report suggested 
the wool industry needed to communicate the ethical attributes of wool through appropriate 
social labelling as such attributes are unobservable to consumers (The Woolmark Company 
2006).  
 
In 2008, AWI launched a strategic plan for the Australian wool industry that focused on 
increasing the demand for wool by tapping into emerging ethical consumer trends for natural 
and sustainable products (Australian Wool Innovation 2008a). However, these reports did not 
include animal welfare as an ethical wool attribute, suggesting that the industry has largely 
ignored the need to address potential animal welfare concerns associated with wool apparel 
or the opportunity to communicate animal-friendly attributes of wool, despite increasing 
demand from retailers for wool from non-mulesed sheep (Broad 2008).  
 
Since the 1990s, consumers whose purchase decisions are influenced by their social, 
environmental, and ethical concerns have become increasingly evident across a range of 
product and service categories (e.g. Matthews 1994). Consumers acting on their ethical 
concerns can force changes in production and marketing activities through their purchasing 
behaviour (De Pelsmacker, Driesen, and Rayp 2005; Friedman 1995; Karpatkin 1998; Rudell 
2006). The potential impact of these ethical consumers on individual businesses and 
industries has generated an ongoing interest among marketers and managers in this aspect 
of consumer behaviour (Caruana 2007; Korthals 2001).  
 
Of particular interest to the present study, the potential impact of ethical consumerism on the 
apparel industry is of increasing interest to marketers, managers, and scholars (Dickson and 
Eckman 2006; Dickson, Loker, and Eckman 2009). Ethical apparel consumer research is a 
relatively recent phenomenon and has largely focused on consumers’ attitudes towards 
labour exploitation (Dickson 1999, 2001; Rudell 2006; Shaw et al. 2007; Shaw et al. 2004) 
and preferences for socially responsible retailers (Dickson 2000). However, consumer 
concerns about other ethical issues in the production of clothing and textiles, such as 
environmental sustainability (Abend 1994; Chen and Davis Burns 2006; Hustvedt and 
Bernard 2008; Shim 1995) and animal welfare (Hustvedt, Peterson, and Chen 2008; 
Peterson, Hustvedt, and Chen 2008; Sneddon, Lee, and Soutar 2009), have also been 
identified.  
 
The extent and potential influence of ethical consumerism has largely been inferred from 
opinion polls (De Pelsmacker et al. 2005). However, there appears to be a discrepancy 
between positive intentions towards ethical consumer behaviour reported in such polls and 
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actual consumer behaviour (De Pelsmacker et al. 2005). This gap between intentions and 
behaviour has been observed in the apparel industry as retailers have found it difficult to sell 
ethical products such as organic or recycled garments (Ortega 1994). Researchers have 
attributed the gap between consumers’ reported intentions and actual behaviour to several 
factors, including social desirability bias (Rudell 2006), higher prices associated with more 
ethically sound products (Ortega 1994), and consumer confusion over product claims (Chen 
and Davis Burns 2006; Morris, Hastak, and Mazis 1995). This suggests the importance of 
exploring consumer response to information provided about the social and ethical attributes 
of such products (Dean and McMullen 2007).  
 
Apparel consumers have expressed a preference for ethical attribute information to be 
provided in garment labels (Dickson 1999; Marymount University Center for Ethical Concerns 
1999), as such labels were perceived to be more useful than lists of ethical apparel stores 
and companies (Marymount University Center for Ethical Concerns 1999). Two recent 
studies investigated consumers’ willingness to purchase wool apparel in response to positive 
and negative information about animal welfare. Hustvedt, Peterson, and Chen (2008) 
identified a segment of consumers who were willing to purchase apparel with positive animal 
welfare attributes, while Peterson, Hustvedt and Chen (2008) found people reduced their 
willingness-to-purchase wool apparel products when given negative information about animal 
welfare. These studies suggest consumers’ ethical concerns about wool apparel include 
animal welfare issues and that labelling may be a useful tool for communicating the positive 
animal welfare attributes of wool apparel to consumers. Given the potentially complex and 
subjective nature of consumers’ response to animal-friendly labelling of wool apparel, an 
exploratory study of ethical consumers’ response to such labels was warranted. Therefore, 
the present study explored ethical consumers’ responses to animal-friendly labelling of wool 
apparel, with a specific focus on their beliefs and attitudes towards such labels.  
 
 

Method 
 
As prior research has not examined ethical consumers’ beliefs and attitudes towards animal-
friendly labelling of wool apparel, focus groups were an appropriate exploratory approach. 
Focus groups enable a researcher to create an environment in which participants have the 
freedom to share their thoughts, opinions, and insights, rather than choose their responses 
from a priori restricted options. Focus groups have been used successfully in studies of 
attitudes towards animal welfare (Southwell et al. 2006) and ethical apparel consumption 
(Rudell 2006).  
 
Five focus groups were undertaken in the United States with 47 female ethical consumers 
as, although Australia is the largest single supplier of wool apparel fibre, the domestic market 
for wool apparel is relatively small. Conversely, the US is a major, established market for 
apparel made with Australian wool and has been the main target for PETA’s ‘Save the 
Sheep’ campaign. As there are a range of definitions of ethical consumerism, a self-
identification approach was used to recruit participants (see Newholm 2005). Recipients of 
an email invitation posted on a University website who responded positively to the screening 
question, ‘are you someone who often considers the social, ethical and environmental 
attributes of products when making purchase decisions?’ were invited to participate in the 
focus groups. Participants were aged from 20 to 66 years, with a median age of 32 years. A 
quarter of the participants had an average family income of $24,999 and about a third (37%) 
had an income of $100,000 or more per annum.  The majority (89%) of participants had a 
Bachelors Degree or higher. Participants had shopped for apparel 20 times, on average, in 
the last 12 months and six times for wool apparel.  
 
Projective techniques were used in the focus groups as they can uncover feelings, beliefs, 
attitudes, and motivation towards objects or behaviours that people may find difficult to 
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describe (Gordon and Langmaid 1988; Webb 1992). Projective techniques have been used 
to explore consumer attitudes towards ‘no-sweat’ social labelling of apparel (Rudell 2006). 
An adaptation of the brand mapping technique described by Gordon and Langmaid (1988) 
was used to explore ethical consumers’ beliefs and attitudes towards the animal-friendly 
labelling of wool apparel. Participants were presented with identical wool garments with two 
competing animal-friendly brands displayed on garment swing tags and asked to describe 
the brands and share their beliefs and attitudes towards them. The semi-ambiguous nature 
of the brand labels allowed participants to interpret them in their own way, while maintaining 
association with the concept of interest (i.e., wool apparel animal-friendly labelling) (Gordon 
and Langmaid 1988). The following animal friendly brands were used in the study: 
 

1) Certified Humane (CH)6 – Independent certification label for animal products sold in 
the USA meeting the Humane Farm Animal Care program standards (i.e., nutritious 
diet without antibiotics or hormones, animals raised with shelter, resting areas, 
sufficient space, and the ability to engage in natural behaviours). 
 

2) Zque7 – New Zealand wool fibre accreditation scheme used by wool apparel brands 
such as SmartWool, assuring environmental, social and economic sustainability, 
animal welfare (non- mulesed), and traceability back to the source (i.e., sheep farm).  
 

The focus group discussions were recorded and transcribed. A thematic analysis of the 
transcribed data was subsequently undertaken using NVivo qualitative data analysis 
software (Welsh 2002). The findings and their implications are discussed below. 
 
 

Findings 
 
Because of the exploratory nature of the study, it is not possible to generalise freely from the 
focus group findings. However, the analysis of the focus group discussions revealed beliefs 
and attitudes that may apply more broadly to consumers’ responses to social labelling. The 
conceptual model of ethical consumers’ response to social labelling presented in Figure 1 
reflects the main themes and sub-themes that emerged from the discussions. The model 
reflects the influence of beliefs and attitudes towards the social label and the focal ethical 
issue(s) articulated by the label on purchase intentions.  
 
The model examines consumer’ beliefs about a label in terms of perceived credibility, 
transparency of the accreditation or certification process, relevance of the label to the 
product, attitude towards the label, and purchase intentions. Further, it is proposed that 
consumers’ beliefs about the ethical issue(s) articulated on the social label and their attitudes 
towards the label and ethical issue influence their purchase intentions. The relationships 
between beliefs, attitudes, and intentions reflect those seen in models such as the Theory of 
Reasoned Action (Ajzen and Fishbein 1980) and the Theory of Planed Behaviour (Ajzen 
1991), and they suggest salient beliefs that may influence purchase behaviour towards 
products that have social labels.  
 
Consumer beliefs and attitudes towards social labels 
 
None of the participants were aware of the Zque or CH labels prior to the discussion, 
implying their beliefs and attitudes reflected their response to the information provided on the 
labels rather than pre-formed attitudes relating to these accreditation systems. Focus group 
participants were evenly divided in their positive and negative attitudes towards label 
information and certification.  

                                                 
6 For further details see www.certifiedhumane.org/ 
7 For further details see www.zque.co.nz/ 
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Figure 1: A conceptual model of ethical consumers’ response to social labelling 
 
 
Beliefs about the credibility and transparency of the products ethical attributes and 
accreditation influenced whether participants held positive or negative attitudes towards label 
information and certification. Some participants expressed positive beliefs about the 
credibility, transparency, and ease of use of information provided on the Zque and CH labels 
(e.g., “I liked [CH] the best because it had the most detail on it…I trusted it the most” and “I 
found that I believed this one [Zque]”). These participants also expressed positive attitudes 
towards product certification, information, and design and positive intentions towards the 
purchase of wool apparel with these social labels. In contrast, other participants expressed 
negative beliefs about the labels, seeing them as difficult to use, opaque, and not credible 
because of the amount of information provided (e.g., “It’s just crowding out, I’m looking for 
simple, you don’t look and read so much”, “the Zque one, it says accredited but it doesn’t say 
by whom”, and “There is a lot of obfuscation here, people are deliberately trying to confound 
you”). These participants also expressed negative attitudes towards label certification, 
information, and design and negative purchase intentions towards products with these social 
labels.  
 
Consumer beliefs and attitudes towards ethical issues  
 
Participants’ awareness and knowledge of the focal ethical issue(s) addressed on the label 
and their perception of its primacy appeared to influence their attitude towards products 
embodying these ethical issues. Most participants expressed positive attitudes towards the 
broad range of ethical issues addressed by the Zque label (e.g., “I like this one that covers it 
all, environmental, social, and economic” and “[Zque] is more sustainable, environmental, 
social, and economic, its sustainability rather than just organic”). The ethical issues 
addressed on the Zque label were numerous and broad enough for all participants to hold 
positive beliefs about the primacy of at least one issue (e.g., “You can trace it back to the 
sheep…that would be way cool”). However, none of the participants were aware of mulesing 
or understanding what ‘non-mulesed’ meant (e.g., “I don’t know what this word [non-
mulesed] means”). Participants who expressed positive beliefs about the primacy of 
environmental, social, and economic sustainability also expressed positive attitudes toward 
the ethical issue and intentions towards the purchase of Zque-labelled wool apparel (e.g., “If 
they were the same price I would still buy the Zque one”).  
 
The CH label evoked positive beliefs about the welfare of animals farmed under this 
certification (e.g., “‘It means the animals have been treated well, they’re all running around 
having happy lives”). Those participants who expressed positive beliefs about the primacy of 
animal welfare and positive attitudes towards this ethical issue also expressed positive 
purchase intentions towards CH-labelled wool apparel (e.g., “I liked [CH] the best, I love 
animals. I would actually pay more for animal rights”). Whereas, participants who expressed 
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negative beliefs about the primacy of animal welfare over human welfare (e.g., “‘If you’re 
going to say something is certified humane, then it should be completely humane, not just 
the animal” and “It says animal welfare but it doesn’t say people welfare”) expressed 
negative purchase intentions towards CH labelled wool apparel.  
 
 

Discussion and Conclusion 
 
This study explored ethical consumers’ response to animal-friendly labelling of wool apparel, 
specifically in terms of their beliefs and attitudes towards two social labels (Zque and 
Certified Humane). The theoretical contribution of the study was to develop a conceptual 
model of ethical consumers’ response to social labelling from the main themes and sub-
themes that emerged from the focus groups. The model aids our understanding of how 
ethical consumers respond to social labelling by identifying the salient beliefs that may 
influence attitudes towards social labels and the focal ethical issues that may influence 
purchase intentions.  
 
The study’s findings have important implications for the wool industry and wool apparel 
manufacturers and retailers. Despite stated concerns about the welfare of animals used in 
the production of wool apparel (Sneddon et al. 2009) and a desire for informative social 
labelling for wool apparel, participants’ responses to the Zque and CH labels suggested 
intentions to purchase wool apparel with social labels are complex. Judging from the positive 
responses relating to the broad range of social, ethical, and environmental attributes 
described on the Zque label and the negative responses towards the limited scope of the CH 
label, people want a broad range of ethical issues to be addressed on wool apparel social 
labels.  
 
In practice, this might require a combination of existing, credible certifications that 
incorporate animal welfare, environmental sustainability, and labour rights in a single label. 
However, the provision of the additional information needed to ensure a broad coverage of 
consumers’ ethical concerns has an element of risk as, although people want more 
information on which to base their purchase decisions, they are often too busy to read such 
labels and make sense of this information while shopping. Wool apparel marketers need to 
balance the provision of clear and understandable explanations of the ethical attributes of 
their products with the need to rapidly engage busy consumers.  
 
Another potential outcome of alerting consumers to the ethical attributes of wool apparel may 
be questions as to the credibility of the claims made on the label. The amount and credibility 
of label information may generate positive attitudes towards the purchase of wool apparel, 
but may also evoke beliefs that animal-friendly wool apparel will be more expensive than 
conventional products, raising further questions about consumers’ willingness to pay for such 
attributes. The present exploratory study suggests the animal-friendly labelling of wool 
apparel may be necessary, but may not be sufficient, to positively influence people’s 
purchase behaviour.  
 
 

References 
 
Abend, Jules (1994), "The Green Wave Swells," Bobbin, 6. 
Ajzen, Icek (1991), "The Theory of Planned Behavior," Organization Behavior and Human 

Decision Processes, 50, 179-211. 
Ajzen, Icek and Martin Fishbein (1980), Understanding Attitudes and Predicting Social 

Behaviour, Englewood Cliffs, NJ: Prentice-Hall. 
Appleby, Michael C. (2004), "Chickens Layer Housing," in Wilson Pond and Alan Bell, eds. 

Encyclopedia of Animal Science, New York: Marcel Dekker, 219-21. 



 8

Australian Wool and Sheep Industry Taskforce (2008), The Australian Wool Industry, AWSIT: 
New South Wales, Australia, 15. 

Australian Wool Innovation (2008a), AWI Strategic Plan: 2008/09-2010/11, AWI Ltd, Sydney, 
NSW, 107. 

Australian Wool Innovation (2008b), "Find out the Facts about Mulesing," 
www.wool.com.au/Mulesing_Alternatives/Background_on_Mulesing/page__9063.asp
xBennett, Richard M. (1996), "People's Willingness to Pay for Farm Animal Welfare," 
Animal Welfare, 5, 3-11. 

Bennett, Richard M. (1997), "Farm Animal Welfare and Food Policy," Food Policy, 22, 281-
88. 

Broad, Megan (2008), "Demand for Wool from Non-Mulesed Sheep Increases," in Country 
Hour, Australia: ABC Country Hour. 

Caruana, Robert J. (2007), "A Sociological Perspective of Consumption Morality," Journal of 
Consumer Behaviour, 6 (Sep.-Oct.), 287-304. 

Chapman, R. E., L. R. Fell, and D. A. Shutt (1994), "A Comparison of Stress in Surgically 
and Non-Surgically Mulesed Sheep," Australian Veterinary Journal, 71, 249-47. 

Chen, Hsiou-Lien and Leslie Davis Burns (2006), "Environmental Analysis of Textile 
Products," Clothing and Textiles Research Journal, 24 (3), 248-61. 

Cook, D. F. and E. C. Steiner (1990), "Susceptibility of Mulesing Wounds to Oviposition and 
Strike Development by the Australian Sheep Blowlfy Lucilia Cuprina," Australian 
Veterinary Journal, 67, 352-55. 

Dawkins, Marion, S. (1980), Animal Suffering. The Science of Animal Welfare: Chapman and 
Hall Ltd. 

De Pelsmacker, Patrick, Leisbeth Driesen, and Glenn Rayp (2005), "Do Consumers Care 
About Ethics? Willingness to Pay for Fair-Trade Coffee," Journal of Consumer Affairs, 
39 (2), 363-85. 

Dean, Thomas, J. and Jeffrey, S. McMullen (2007), "Toward a Theory of Sustainable 
Entrepreneurship: Reducing Environmental Degradation through Entrepreneurial 
Action," Journal of Business Venturing, 27, 50-76. 

Dickson, Marsha, A. (1999), "US Consumers' Knowledge of and Concern with Apparel 
Sweatshops," Journal of Fashion Marketing and Management, 3 (1), 44-55. 

Dickson, Marsha, A. (2000), "Personal Values, Beliefs, Knowledge, and Attitudes Relating to 
Intentions to Purchase Apparel from Socially Responsible Businesses," Clothing and 
Textiles Research Journal, 18 (1), 19-30. 

Dickson, Marsha, A. (2001), "Utility of No Sweat Labels for Apparel Consumers: Profiling 
Label Users and Predicting Their Purchases," Journal of Consumer Affairs, 35 (1), 
96-119. 

Dickson, Marsha, A. and Molly Eckman (2006), "Social Responsibility: The Concept as 
Defined by Apparel and Textile Scholars," Clothing and Textiles Research Journal, 
24, 178-91. 

Dickson, Marsha, A., Susanne Loker and Molly Eckman (2009), Social Responsibility in the 
Global Apparel Industry, New York: Fairchild Books. 

Fell, L. R. and D. A. Shutt (1988), "Salivary Cortisol and Behavioural Indicators of Stress in 
Sheep," in Proceedings of the Australian Society of Animal Production, Vol. 17, 186-
89. 

Fell, L. R. and D. A. Shutt (1989), "Behavioural and Hormonal Responses to Acute Surgical 
Stress in Sheep," Applied Animal Behaviour Science, 22, 283-94. 

Frewer, Lynne, J. and Brain Salter (2002), "Public Attitudes, Scientific Advice and the Politics 
of Regulatory Policy: The Case of BSE," Science and Public Policy, 29, 137-45. 

Friedman, Monroe (1995), "On Promoting a Sustainable Future through Consumer Activism," 
Journal of Social Issues, 51 (4), 197-216. 

Gherardi, Steven, G. (2002), "Mulesing for Flystrike Control," in Farmnote, Perth, WA: 
Western Australia Department of Agriculture. 

Gordon, Wendy and Roy Langmaid (1988), Qualitative Market Research, Aldershot: Gower. 



 9

Harper, Gemma, C. and Aikaterini Makatouni (2002), "Consumer Perception of Organic Food 
Production and Farm Animal Welfare," British Food Journal, 104 (3-5), 287-99. 

Harrington, S. A. and E. C. Steiner (1993), "Susceptibility of Freshly-Mulesed Lambs to 
Flystrike and the Effectiveness of Propetamphos as a Wound Dressing," Australian 
Veterinary Journal, 70 (190-191). 

Harrison, Ruth (1992), "Case Study: Animal Welfare," in Robert, J. Berry ed. Environmental 
Dilemmas: Ethics and Decisions, London: Chapman & Hall. 

Horton, Jeanette, D. and Scott, C. Champion (2001), "Wool Producer Knowledge of Flystrike 
Control," in FLICS Conference, Launceston, Tasmania, Australia. 

Hustvedt, Gwendolyn and John, C. Bernard (2008), "Consumer Willingness to Pay for 
Sustainable Apparel: The Influence of Labelling for Fibre Origin and Production 
Methods," International Journal of Consumer Studies, 32, 491-98. 

Hustvedt, Gwendolyn, Hikaru Hanawa-Peterson, and Yun-Ju Chen (2008), "Labelling Wool 
Products for Animal Welfare and Environmental Impact," International Journal of 
Consumer Studies, 32 (5), 427-37. 

Karlsson, John, Diane, L. Evans, and Johan, C. Greeff (2001), "Future Options to Reduce 
Reliance on Surgical Muelsing," in FLICS conference, Launceston, Tasmania, 
Australia. 

Karpatkin, Rhoda, H. (1998), "More than Money: Memo to Members," Consumer Reports, 
63(7), 7. 

Korthals, Michiel (2001), "Taking Consumers Seriously: Two Concepts of Consumer 
Sovereignty," Journal of Agricultural and Environmental Ethics, 14 (2), 201-15. 

Lee, C. and A. D. Fisher (2007), "Welfare Consequences of Mulesing Sheep," Australian 
Veterinary Journal, 85 (3), 89-93. 

MAF (1996), "Code of Recommendations and Minimum Standards for the Welfare of Sheep" 
in Code of Animal Welfare: New Zealand Ministry of Agriculture and Forestry. 

Marymount University Center for Ethical Concerns (1999), "The Consumer and 
Sweatshops." 

Matthews, V. (1994), "Give Farmers a Coffee Break," in Marketing Week, 26. 
McLachlan, Ian and Robert Pietsch (2005), "A Declaration of Commitments Made by the 

Australian Wool and Sheep Industry Taskforce in Relation to Animal Welfare and the 
Phasing out of Mulesing," Australian Wool and Sheep Industry Taskforce, 9. 

Millward Brown Pty Ltd. (2007), "Dive into Fabric Characteristics and Appeal," Sydney, NSW: 
Australian Wool Innovation Limited, 14. 

Morris, Louis, A., Manoj Hastak, and Micheal, B. Mazis (1995), "Consumer Comprehension 
of Environmental Advertising and Labeling Claims," Journal of Consumer Affairs, 29 
(2), 328-50. 

Morris, Michael, C. (2000), "Ethical Issues Associated with Sheep Fly Strike Research, 
Prevention and Control," Journal of Agricultural and Environmental Ethics, 13 (3-4), 
205-17. 

Newholm, Terry (2005), "Case Studying Ethical Consumers' Projects and Strategies," in Rob 
Harrison, Terry Newholm and Deidre Shaw, eds. The Ethical Consumer, London: 
SAGE Publications Ltd, 107-24. 

Ortega, Bob (1994), "Organic Cotton May Feel Soft to Touch, but Its Hard to Sell," Wall 
Street Journal, B1, B18. 

People for the Ethical Treatment of Animals (2004), "An Examination of Two Major Forms of 
Cruelty in Australian Wool Production: Mulesing and Live Exports," Norfolk, VA: 
People for the Ethical Treatment of Animals 27. 

People for the Ethical Treatment of Animals (2005), "The Animals: Death "Down Under"," 
www.savethesheep.com/animals.asp. 

People for the Ethical Treatment of Animals (2008), "H&M, Perry Ellis, Adidas, and Others 
Boycott Mulesed Wool," www.savethesheep.com/f-m_perryellis_adidas_boycott.asp. 

Peterson, Hikaru, Hanawa, Gwendolyn Hustvedt, and Yun-Ju Chen (2008), "US Consumer's 
Willingness to Pay for Wool Product Attributes," in Southern Agricultural Economics 
Association Annual Meeting, Dallas, TX. 



 10

Phillips, Clive, J. (2009), "A Review of Mulesing and Other Methods to Control Flystrike 
(Cutaneous Myiasis) in Sheep," Animal Welfare, 18, 113-21. 

Primary Industries Standing Committee (2006), "Model Code of Practice for the Welfare of 
Animals: The Sheep," Canberra, 23. 

Rolfe, John (1999), "Ethical Rules and the Demand for Free Range Eggs," Economic 
Analysis & Policy, 29 (2), 187-206. 

Rollin, Bernard (1990), "Animal Welfare, Animal Rights and Agriculture," Journal of Animal 
Science, 68 (10), 3456-61. 

Rollin, Bernard (1995), Farm Animal Welfare: Social, Bioethical and Research Issues, Ames: 
Iowa State University Press. 

Rollin, Bernard (2004), "Annual Meeting Keynote Address: Animal Agriculture and Emerging 
Social Ethics for Agriculture," Journal of Animal Science, 82, 955-64. 

Rollin, Bernard (2006), Animal Rights and Human Morality, Buffalo, NY: Prometheus Books. 
Rudell, Fredrica (2006), "Shopping with a Social Conscience: Consumer Attitudes toward 

Sweatshop Labour," Clothing and Textiles Research Journal, 24, 282-96. 
Shaw, Deidre, Edward Shui, Gillian Hogg, Elaine Wilson, and Louise Hassan (2004), 

"Fashion Victim? The Impact of Sweatshop Concerns on Clothing Choice," Journal of 
Strategic Marketing, 44 (14), 427-440. 

Shaw, Deidre, Edward Shiu, Louise Hassan, Caroline Bekin, and Gillina Hogg (2007), 
"Intending to Be Ethical: An Examination of Consumer Choice in Sweatshop 
Avoidance," Advances in Consumer Research, 34, 31-38. 

Shim, Soyeon (1995), "Environmentalism and Consumers' Clothing Disposal Patterns: An 
Exploratory Study," Clothing and Textiles Research Journal, 13 (1), 38-48. 

Shutt, D. A., L. R. Fell, R. Connell, A. K. Bell, C. A. Wallace, and A. I. Smith (1987), "Stress-
Induced Changes in Plasma Concentrations of Immunoreactive Β-Endorphin and 
Cortisol in Response to Routine Surgical Procedures in Lambs," Australian Journal of 
Biological Science, 40, 97-103. 

Sneddon, Joanne, N., Julie, A. Lee, and Geoffrey, N. Soutar (2009), "Ethical Issues that 
Impact on Wool Apparel Purchases," in ANZMAC conference proceedings, ed. S 
Purchase, Melbourne: ANZMAC. 

Southwell, A., A. Bessey, and B. Barker (2006), Attitudes Towards Animal Welfare, Manuka, 
ACT: Department of Agriculture, Fisheries and Forestry, 53. 

Steenkamp, Jan-Benedict, E. M. (1997), "Dynamics in Consumer Behaviour with Respect to 
Agriculture and Food Products," in Berend Wierenga, Aad van Tilberg, Klaus G. 
Grunert, Jan-Benedict Steenkamp and Michel Wedel eds. Agricultural Marketing and 
Consumer Behaviour in a Changing World, Dordrect: Kluwer, 207-15. 

The Woolmark Company (2006), Potential Customer Requirements & Demand for 'Ethical-
Wool', Melbourne, 29. 

Tuyttens, Frank, A. M., Ester Struelens, Suzy Van Gansbeke, and Bart Ampe (2008), 
"Factors Influencing Farmers' Responses to Welfare Legislation: A Case Study of 
Gestation Sow Housing in Flanders," Livestock Science, 116, 289-99. 

Verbeke, W., M. J.  van Oekel, N. Warnants, J. Viane, and C. V. Boucque (1999), "Consumer 
Perception. Facts and Possibilities to Improve Acceptability of Health and Sensory 
Characteristics of Pork," Meat Sciences, 53, 77-99. 

Webb, John, R. (1992), Understanding and Designing Marketing Research, London: 
Academic Press. 

Welsh, Elaine (2002), "Dealing with Data: Using Nvivo in the Qualitative Data Analysis 
Process," http://nbn-resolving.de/urn:nbn:de:0114-fqs0202260. 

 
 


