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Abstract
AIM: To investigate the effects of γ-aminobutyric acid
(GABA) on the spontaneous contraction of mouse ileac
smooth muscle and the interactions between GABA and
β-receptor and nitric oxide (NO).

METHODS: The contraction changes of the isolated
smooth muscle stripswere recorded by tension transducer,
and the change of the tension was used as the marker to
evaluate the effects of GABA. The effects of ODQ, L-NNA,
propranolol on the action of GABA were also analyzed. .

RESULTS: GABA inhibited the spontaneous contraction of
mouse ileum at the concentrations ranging from 1 10-6

to 1 10-3 mol/L. The contraction amplitudes were de-
creased by (34.71 7.35)% and (22.23 4.69)%,
respectively, when 1 10-6 and 1 10-3 mol/L GABA were
used. Picrotoxin showed no significant effect on the in-
hibitory actions caused by GABA. The effects of GABA
on the spontaneous contraction were decreased in the pres-
ence of L-NNA or ODQ. L-Arg (5 10-7 mol/L) decreased
the effect of GABA at the concentration of 1 10-6 mol/L,
but not at the concentration of 1 10-3 mol/L. Propranolol
(3 10-6 mol/L) reduced the effect of GABA on the con-

traction of mouse ileac smooth muscle.

CONCLUSION: GABA inhibits the spontaneous contrac-
tion of mouse ileac smooth muscle. This effect, which is
influenced by the excitation of β-receptor may need the
participation of cGMP and NO.
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